1 S 238/1998

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on NA at .

No. S 238

CUSTOMS ACT
(CHAPTER 70)

CUSTOMS (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 1998

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 143 of the Customs
Act, the Minister for Finance hereby makes the following
Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Customs (Amendment)
Regulations 1998 and shall come into operation on 15th April 1998.
Amendment of Second Schedule

2. The Second Schedule to the Customs Regulations (Rg 2) is
amended —

(a) by deleting “$7,600” in item 1 (a) and (b) and substituting
in each case “$8,500”;

(b) by deleting “$24,000” in item 2 (b) and substituting
“$26,0007;
(c) bydeleting “$45,000” in item 5 and substituting “$48,000”;

(d) by deleting “$15,000” in item 6 and substituting “$16,500”;
and
(e) by deleting “$54,000” in item 8 and substituting “$58,000.

[G.N. Nos. S 234/93; S 371/94; S 141/95; S 95/96;
S 504/96; S 554/97]



