
Singapore Statutes Online Published in Subsidiary Legislation Supplement 
on 15 Oct 1999 PDF created date on: 26 Feb 2022

Passports (Amendment No. 5) Regulations 1999

Table of Contents

Enacting Formula

1 Citation and commencement

2 Amendment of regulation 4

3 Amendment of regulation 5

4 Amendment of regulation 7

5 New regulation 7A

6 Amendment of First Schedule

7 New Fourth Schedule

No. S 456

PASSPORTS ACT
(CHAPTER 220)

PASSPORTS (AMENDMENT NO. 5) REGULATIONS 1999

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 3(1) of the Passports Act, the Minister 
for Home Affairs hereby makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1.  These Regulations may be cited as the Passports (Amendment No. 5) Regulations 
1999 and shall come into operation on 18th October 1999.



Singapore Statutes Online Published in Subsidiary Legislation Supplement 
on 15 Oct 1999 PDF created date on: 26 Feb 2022

Amendment of regulation 4

2.  Regulation 4 of the Passports Regulations (Rg 1) is amended by inserting, 
immediately after paragraph (1), the following paragraphs:

“(1A)  An application for a Singapore passport must be accompanied by one 
photograph of the applicant.

(1B)  An application for a certificate of identity or other document of identity for 
travel purposes must be accompanied by 2 photographs of the applicant.

(1C)  The photographs referred to in paragraphs (1A) and

(1B)  must have been taken within 3 months before the date of application and 
must comply with the specifications set out in the Fourth Schedule.”.

Amendment of regulation 5

3.  Regulation 5(2) of the Passports Regulations is amended by deleting the words “10 
years” and substituting the words “11 years”.

Amendment of regulation 7

4.  Regulation 7(1) of the Passports Regulations is amended by deleting the words “10 
years” in the 2nd and 5th lines and substituting in each case the words “11 years”.

New regulation 7A

5.  The Passports Regulations are amended by inserting, immediately after 
regulation 7, the following regulation:

“Collection of Singapore passport

7A.—(1)  An applicant for the issue or renewal of a Singapore passport must 
collect the Singapore passport within 3 months from the date of the notice from an 
authorised officer informing the applicant that the Singapore passport is ready for 
collection.

(2)  An authorised officer may cancel any Singapore passport that is not 
collected within the period provided in paragraph (1).

(3)  The fee payable in respect of a Singapore passport that is cancelled under 
paragraph (2) shall not be refunded.”.

Amendment of First Schedule

6.  Paragraph 1 of the First Schedule to the Passports Regulations is amended —


