Muslim Marriage and Divorce (Amendment) Rules 2002
Table of Contents
Enacting Formula

1 Citation and commencement

2 Amendment of Third Schedule

No. S 101

ADMINISTRATION OF MUSLIM LAW ACT
(CHAPTER 3)

MUSLIM MARRIAGE AND DIVORCE (AMENDMENT) RULES 2002

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 145 of the Administration of Muslim
Law Act, the President of Singapore hereby makes the following Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules may be cited as the Muslim Marriage and Divorce (Amendment)
Rules 2002 and shall be deemed to have come into operation on 1st December 2001.
Amendment of Third Schedule

2. PartI of the Third Schedule to the Muslim Marriage and Divorce Rules (R 1) is
amended —

(a) by deleting “$80” in item 3 and substituting “$128”;

(b) by deleting “$19” in item 5 and substituting “$40”’;

(¢) by deleting “$29” in item 7 and substituting “$180”’;

(d) by deleting the words “(per page)” in item 7,

(e) by deleting “$25” in item 8 (b)(i) and substituting “$35”;

. . Published in Subsidiary Legislation Supplement .
Singapore Statutes Online on 28 Feb 2002 PDF created date on: 25 Feb 2022



