
Singapore Statutes Online Published in Subsidiary Legislation Supplement 
on 30 Mar 2004 PDF created date on: 25 Feb 2022

Wholesome Meat and Fish (Fees) (Amendment) Rules 2004

Table of Contents

Enacting Formula

1 Citation and commencement

2 Amendment of Schedule

No. S 157

WHOLESOME MEAT AND FISH ACT
(CHAPTER 349A)

WHOLESOME MEAT AND FISH (FEES) (AMENDMENT) RULES 2004

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 42 of the Wholesome Meat and Fish 
Act, the Minister for National Development hereby makes the following Rules:

Citation and commencement

1.  These Rules may be cited as the Wholesome Meat and Fish (Fees) (Amendment) 
Rules 2004 and shall come into operation on 1st April 2004.

Amendment of Schedule

2.  The Schedule to the Wholesome Meat and Fish (Fees) Rules (R 1) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$840” in the third column of item 1 in Part II and substituting 
“$920”; 

(b) by deleting item 1 in Part IV; and

(c) by deleting “$1.15” in the second column of item 2 in Part V and 
substituting “$1.20”. 

[G.N. No. S 94/2001]

Made this 16th day of March 2004.


