Private Investigation and Security Agencies (Amendment) Regulations 2004
Table of Contents
Enacting Formula

1 Citation and commencement

2 Deletion and substitution of regulation 2

3 Amendment of regulation 16

4 Amendment of regulation 18

5 Amendment of Schedule

6 Transitional provisions

No. S 558

PRIVATE INVESTIGATION AND SECURITY AGENCIES ACT
(CHAPTER 249)

PRIVATE INVESTIGATION AND SECURITY AGENCIES (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2004

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 27 of the Private Investigation and
Security Agencies Act, the Minister for Home Affairs hereby makes the following
Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Private Investigation and Security Agencies
(Amendment) Regulations 2004 and shall be deemed to have come into operation on 30th
August 2004.

Singapore Statutes Online Published in Subsidiary Legislation Supplement PDF created date on: 25 Feb 2022
on 02 Sep 2004



Deletion and substitution of regulation 2

2. Regulation 2 of the Private Investigation and Security Agencies Regulations (Rg 1)
(referred to in these Regulations as the principal Regulations) is deleted and the
following regulation substituted therefor:

“Application for licence

2.—(1) Subject to paragraphs (2), (3) and (4), every application for a private
investigator’s licence or a security guard agency’s licence shall be made using —

(a) the electronic application service provided by the Government; or
(b) the electronic application service provided by the licensing officer.

(2) Subject to paragraph (4), in the event of a malfunction or failure of the
electronic application service provided by the Government, an application for a
private investigator’s licence or a security guard agency’s licence shall be made
using the electronic application service provided by the licensing officer.

(3) Subject to paragraph (4), in the event of a malfunction or failure of the
electronic application service provided by the licensing officer, an application for a
private investigator’s licence or a security guard agency’s licence shall be made
using the electronic application service provided by the Government.

(4) In the event of a malfunction or failure of both the electronic application
service provided by the Government and the electronic application service
provided by the licensing officer, an application for a private investigator’s licence
or a security guard agency’s licence shall be made in Form A in the Schedule.

(5) The form prescribed for an application made using the electronic
application service provided by the Government shall be the electronic form
provided for that electronic application service at https://licences.business.gov.sg/.

(6) The form prescribed for an application made using the electronic
application service provided by the licensing officer shall be the electronic form
provided for that electronic application service at http://www.spf.gov.sg/licence/.”.

Amendment of regulation 16

3. Regulation 16 (2) of the principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$50” and
substituting “$40”.

Amendment of regulation 18

4. Regulation 18 (2) of the principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$45” and
substituting “$20”.

Published in Subsidiary Legislation Supplement

on 02 Sep 2004 PDF created date on: 25 Feb 2022

Singapore Statutes Online



Amendment of Schedule

5. Forms A, B and C of the Schedule to the principal Regulations are deleted and the
following Forms substituted therefor:

FORM A

Regulation 2 {4}

PRIVATE INVESTIGATION AND SECURITY AGENCIES ACT
(CHAPTER 249}

PRIVATE INVESTIGATION AND SECURITY AGENCIES
REGULATIONS

APPLICATION FOR A LICENCE T

[ Act as a Private Inovestigator

[0 Carry on the business of 4 Private Investigator

[0 Carry on the business of 4 Security Guard Agency

FPART I — PARTICULAES OF FILER fapplizable only o applicnion made by o sinllfmonbser of @ professional
linm oo & represeninive ambiorised by ihe applicin oo mike ihe lieence spplivmiong

Name MRICFIN Na,
Name of Registered Company/Bisiness' Organisation ACRA Registration Na.
Email Address Coniact Mo {Pager Mobila Home Offics Moy

FART I — PARTICULARS OF APPLICAN]

Name SAppoiniment in Proposed Agenc
Audclress Frmail Adilres
NEIC Mo Maticmality Diaie of Birik Coniact Mo {Pager Mobile Home Oihce Moy

Frperience in seeurity anclior investigation work!

From { Year) T [ Year)

Highzst ranbappoiniment hekd From {Year) T i Y ey Highest Educational Cmfification

FAET I — PARTICULARES OF EEGISTEREDR COMPANYRUSINESSCO-OPFERATIVE SOCIETY

Name of Registered Company/Bisiness' Co-opertive Socien ACILAMRCS Regotration Mo,

Mckdress of Regeiered CompanyBusines=\Co-opemtive Socicly | Conlad No. o Ma.

Type of Company Bsiness

Singapore Statutes Online Published in Subsidiary Legislation Supplement PDF created date on: 25 Feb 2022
on 02 Sep 2004



PART IV — PARTICULARS OF PARTNERGVBIRECTORSVOTFICE-EEARER %)

Mame NRICFIN Passport Na,® [aie of Birth
Appaintment Highest Edussticnal Qualificatian
Experience in securite andlar investgaiion work!

From {Yaary T { Year)
Highest rank/appoiniment hekl From {Year) To {Weari
Mame N RICIFIN Passport Na.* Daie of Birth
Appointment Highest Edduational Qualification
Expericnce in securite andlor investiafion work!

From {Year) To {Weari
Highesi rank/appainiment hekd From {Year) Ta {Yeari
Name NRICFIN Passpori Na.® Diaie of Birih
Appointment Highest Eduational Qualification
Expericnes in security andlor investgation work?

From (Year: T { Year)
Highest rank'appoiniment hekl From {Year) To {Weari
Name NRICFIN Passpori Na.™ Daie of Birth
Appointmeni Highest Edueational Oualificaion
Expericnes in s=curity and/or investgstion work!

From {Yeard T Year)
Highest rank/appoiniment hekl From {Year) To {Weari

Singapore Statutes Online

Published in Subsidiary Legislation Supplement
on 02 Sep 2004

PDF created date on: 25 Feb 2022



