1 S 554/2013

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 30th August 2013 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 554

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT
(CHAPTER 276)

ROAD TRAFFIC
(MOTOR VEHICLES, REGISTRATION AND LICENSING)
(AMENDMENT NO. 7) RULES 2013

In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 34 and 140 of the
Road Traffic Act, the Minister for Transport hereby makes the
following Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules may be cited as the Road Traffic (Motor Vehicles,
Registration and Licensing) (Amendment No. 7) Rules 2013 and shall
come into operation on Ist September 2013.

Amendment of rule 3D

2. Rule 3D(5) of the Road Traffic (Motor Vehicles, Registration and
Licensing) Rules (R 5) (referred to in these Rules as the principal
Rules) is amended by deleting “$353.10” in sub-paragraph (ii) and
substituting “$385.20”.

Amendment of rule 12B

3. Rule 12B of the principal Rules is amended —

(a) by deleting “$23.54” in paragraphs (1) and (4) and
substituting in each case “$25.68; and

(b) by deleting “$58.85” in paragraph (3) and substituting
“$64.20”.
Amendment of First Schedule

4. The First Schedule to the principal Rules is amended by deleting
Parts IA, IB and IC and substituting the following Parts:



S 554/2013 2

“PART TA

Rule 3D(4)(b)
FEES TO BE PAID TO AUTHORITY FOR APPLICATION

FOR
BATCH TYPE-APPROVAL IN RESPECT OF
UNREGISTERED VEHICLES
Description of vehicle Fee payable
(inclusive of
GST)

Vehicle or batch of vehicles which falls under
the category of —
(a) motor cycles, scooters, mopeds and motor $89.88

cycles with side-cars
(b) goods vehicles and goods-cum-passenger $256.80

vehicles
(¢) buses $256.80
(d) motor cars and any other vehicles (other $256.80

than trailers)
(e) trailers Nil.

PART IB
Rule 3D(4)(c)
FEES TO BE PAID TO AUTHORITY FOR APPLICATION
FOR

TYPE-APPROVAL IN RESPECT OF
UNREGISTERED VEHICLES

Description of vehicle Fee payable
(inclusive of
GST)

Model of a vehicle which falls under the
category of —



