
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 29th May 2015 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 329

FIRE SAFETYACT
(CHAPTER 109A)

FIRE SAFETY
(PETROLEUM AND FLAMMABLE MATERIALS)

(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2015

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 61 of the Fire Safety
Act, the Minister for Home Affairs makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Fire Safety (Petroleum and
Flammable Materials) (Amendment) Regulations 2015 and come into
operation on 1 August 2015.

Amendment of First Schedule

2.—(1) Part I of the First Schedule to the Fire Safety (Petroleum and
Flammable Materials) Regulations (Rg 7) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$77” in the second column of item 1 and
substituting “$105”;

(b) by deleting “$77” in the second column of item 2(a) and
substituting “$212”;

(c) by deleting “$132” in the second column of item 2(b) and
substituting “$256”;

(d) by deleting “$33” in the second column of item 2(c) and
substituting “$48”;

(e) by deleting “$77” in the second column of item 3(a) and
substituting “$184”;

(f) by deleting “$132” in the second column of item 3(b) and
substituting “$242”;

S 329/20151


