1 S 304/2016

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 30th June 2016 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 304

STAMP DUTIES ACT
(CHAPTER 312)

STAMP DUTIES ACT
(AMENDMENT OF FOURTH AND FIFTH SCHEDULES)
NOTIFICATION 2016

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 78(1) of the Stamp
Duties Act, the Minister for Finance makes the following Notification:
Citation and commencement

1. This Notification is the Stamp Duties Act (Amendment of Fourth
and Fifth Schedules) Notification 2016 and comes into operation on
1 July 2016.

Amendment of Fourth Schedule
2. The Fourth Schedule to the Stamp Duties Act is amended —

(a) by deleting “$180” in items 1, 1A and 1B and substituting in
each case “$2007;

(b) by deleting “$36” in item 2 and substituting “$40”; and
(¢) by deleting “$108” in items 3 and 4 and substituting in each
case “$120”.
Deletion and substitution of Fifth Schedule

3. The Fifth Schedule to the Stamp Duties Act is deleted and the
following Schedule substituted therefor:

“FIFTH SCHEDULE
Section 37(4)
VALUATION FEES
Subject matter of Instrument Fee

1. Any immovable property — $94



