
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 1 June 2018 at 5 pm.

No. S 362

PUBLIC UTILITIES ACT
(CHAPTER 261)

PUBLIC UTILITIES
(WATERBORNE TAX)

(AMENDMENT) ORDER 2018

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 20(4) of the Public
Utilities Act, the Minister for the Environment and Water Resources
makes the following Order:

Citation and commencement

1. This Order is the Public Utilities (Waterborne Tax) (Amendment)
Order 2018 and comes into operation on 1 July 2018.

Amendment of Schedule

2. The Schedule to the Public Utilities (Waterborne Tax) Order 2013
(G.N. No. S 43/2013) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$0.78” in paragraphs (a) and (b)(i) in the
second column of item 1 of Parts 1 and 2 and substituting in
each case “$0.92”;

(b) by deleting “$1.02” in paragraph (b)(ii) in the second
column of item 1 of Parts 1 and 2 and substituting in each
case “$1.18”; and

(c) by deleting “$0.78” in the second column of item 2 of
Parts 1 and 2 and substituting in each case “$0.92”.

Transitional provisions

3.—(1) Despite paragraph 2, the sum total of the specified amounts
of waterborne tax for the relevant billing month payable by the owner
or occupier of any premises is calculated by —

S 362/20181


