
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 31 March 2021 at 5 pm.

No. S 206

HAZARDOUS WASTE (CONTROL OF EXPORT,
IMPORT AND TRANSIT) ACT

(CHAPTER 122A)

HAZARDOUS WASTE (CONTROL OF EXPORT,
IMPORT AND TRANSIT) (AMENDMENT)

REGULATIONS 2021

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 48 of the Hazardous
Waste (Control of Export, Import and Transit) Act, the Minister for
Sustainability and the Environment makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations are the Hazardous Waste (Control of Export,
Import and Transit) (Amendment) Regulations 2021 and come into
operation on 1 April 2021.

Amendment of Schedule

2. The Schedule to the Hazardous Waste (Control of Export, Import
and Transit) Regulations (Rg 1) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$335” in item 1(a) and substituting “$370”;

(b) by deleting “$125” in item 1(b) and substituting “$165”;
and

(c) by deleting “$45” in item 2 and substituting “$85”.
[G.N. Nos. S 797/2014; S 862/2020]

S 206/20211


