
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 17 September 2021 at 5 pm.

No. S 698

ENVIRONMENTAL PUBLIC HEALTH ACT
(CHAPTER 95)

ENVIRONMENTAL PUBLIC HEALTH
(PUBLIC CLEANSING) (AMENDMENT NO. 3)

REGULATIONS 2021

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 111 of the
Environmental Public Health Act, the National Environment
Agency, with the approval of the Minister for Sustainability and
the Environment, makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations are the Environmental Public Health (Public
Cleansing) (Amendment No. 3) Regulations 2021 and come into
operation on 1 October 2021.

Amendment of Second Schedule

2. Paragraph 7 of the Second Schedule to the Environmental Public
Health (Public Cleansing) Regulations (Rg 3) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$41.57” in sub-paragraphs (2)(a) and (3) and
substituting in each case “$42.80”;

(b) by deleting “$106.58” in sub-paragraph (2)(b) and
substituting “$128.40”;

(c) by deleting “$149.22” in sub-paragraph (2)(c) and
substituting “$192.60”;

(d) by deleting “$490.30” in sub-paragraph (2)(d) and
substituting “$513.60”; and

S 698/20211


