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[ REPUBLIC ACT NO. 36, September 30, 1946 ]

CENSUS ACT OF NINETEEN HUNDRED AND FORTY-SIX

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the Philippines in
Congress assembled:




SECTION 1. A population census of the Philippines and such other related data as
may be decided upon by the President of the Philippines shall be taken not later
than January 1, 1947. The President shall, by executive order proclaim any day
selected for census-taking as Census Day, and from that time on the enumeration
shall proceed on consecutive days from daylight to darkness including Sundays and
Holidays, until completed: Provided, That the census of population shall be
completed, proclaimed and published within one year after January 1, 1947.




SEC. 2. All data prescribed to be gathered by this Act or by regulations issued under
this Act shall be as of twelve o'clock of the night preceding Census Day: Provided,
That if it shall be deemed necessary to require that the enumeration of any part or
parts of the Philippines should begin before Census Day, the President shall, by
proclamation, fix the time when enumeration shall begin.




SEC. 3. The direct execution of the provisions of this Act shall be entrusted to the
Office of the President, through the Bureau of the Census and Statistics, with the
cooperation of the Department of the Interior.




SEC. 4. The persons to be enumerated shall comprise all those persons who spent
the night preceding Census Day within the jurisdiction of the Philippines, including
all those who have subsequently died or departed therefore, and all persons who
spent the said night on any ship within the jurisdiction of the Philippines: Provided,
That persons belonging to the armed forces of the United States in the Philippines
shall be separately recorded and except in the case of the citizens of the Philippines,
shall not be included in any official statement of the population of the Philippines
when such population is given as a part of the total population of the United States:
And provided, further, That no enumeration of the persons belonging to such armed
forces of the United States in the Philippines shall be undertaken without the
consent of the officers commanding the military and naval forces, respectively.




SEC. 5. The supervisors, enumerators and other subordinate personnel for this
census work shall be drafted mostly from the personnel of the Government,
including provincial, city and municipal officials and employees, school teachers,
field forces of the different bureaus and offices, city and municipal police forces, and
members of the Philippine Army: Provided, however, That such officers and
employees of the Government as may be designated Census Officers may be given a
recess from their ordinary duties by the President of the Philippines.




SEC. 6. Every officer or employee of the National or of any provincial or municipal



government who may be designated by the President of the Philippines to perform
any duties in connection with census operation is hereby required to accept such
designation and to perform such duties, and it shall be the duty of every head or
chief of department, bureau, office, division, or service, or of the Chief executive of
any provincial or municipal government, to authorize any necessary detail and to
relieve any officer or employee from his regular duties for such period, if any, as
may be required for the purposes of this section: Provided, That during the
designation of such persons they shall continue to receive, their salaries in full but
not from census: funds, and they shall not be entitled to any additional
compensation except such per diems and traveling expenses as are authorized by
this act.

SEC. 7. No head or chief of department, bureau, office, division or service shall
order the, transfer of any, officer or employee. under him, who may have, been
detailed to the Census in any locality to another locality until the work of such
person in connection therewith is completed, or Without advising the Office of the
President of such proposed transfer at least fifteen days before such proposed
transfer is to become effective.

SEC. 8. The duties of all persons appointed pr designated under this Act shall begin
at such times as shall be fixed by the President of the Philippines and shall continue
until such persons are relieved of such duties; Provided, however, That subsequent
to such relief persons so appointed or designated may be required to perform such
further services as may be necessary for the carrying out of the purposes of this
Act.

SEC. 9. Every officer and employee whose services are engaged for the census work
shall take and subscribe an oath or affirmation to do and perform accurately: and to
the best of his ability such duties as may he required of him. An oath or affirmation
prescribed by this Act to be taken by any officer or employee of the Office of., the
President or of the Department of the Interior in connection with his duties there
under may be, taken: and subscribed to before superior officers of such
departments, who are hereby authorized to administer oaths for the; purposes of
this Act, or before any national, provincial, or municipal official authorized to
administer oaths, and all such officials are hereby required to administer such oaths
on request: Provided, that no such person shall receive any fee or compensation for
the administration of such oaths: And Provided, further, that such oath of office
should be exempt from documentary stamp tax.

SEC. 10. There shall be Provincial, City and Municipal" Census Boards which shall
direct the enumeration work   within their respective jurisdictions and which shall
assume full responsibility for assembling and consolidating census returns and
forwarding them through channels as herein provided to the Department of the
Interior.   The Provincial Census Boards shall be composed of the members of the
provincial board, and the City or Municipal Census Boards, of the members of the
city or municipal councils, as the case may be.

SEC. 11. Census returns shall be prepared in duplicate, the original of which shall be
forwarded to the Department of the Interior and the duplicate kept in the city or
town of origin as part of the permanent record therein City census returns shall be
forwarded direct to the Department of the Interior, while the returns from each
municipality or municipal district shall be coursed through the Provincial Census



Board which shall review and consolidate therein contained for the purpose of
preparing a census report for the province.

SEC. 12. There shall be in each representative district a District Census Supervisor
and in each municipality or municipal district a Municipal Census Supervisor who
shall act as technical advisers to the census boards and who shall supervise the
work of the census enumerators to facilitate filling of census schedules in
accordance with rules and regulations issued by higher census authorities and within
the time prescribed for census-taking.  Their compensations shall be determined by
the President of the Philippines, but in no case shall a District Census Supervisor
draw more than two hundred pesos a month, and a Municipal Census Supervisor
more than one hundred pesos a month: Provided, That during: their term of
employment they shall be entitled to reimbursement for actual and necessary
expenses.

SEC. 13. Each enumerator or other employee detailed to service as an enumerator
shall be charged with the collection in his subdivision of the facts as the Office of the
President may, direct him to do, which may include the fingerprints of both hands of
all persons to he enumerated, it shall be his duty to visit personally each dwelling
house, in his subdivision, and each family therein, and each individual living out of a
family in any place of abode, and, by inquiry made of the head of each family, or of
the; member thereof deemed most competent and. trustworthy; or of such
individual living, out of a family, to obtain each, and every item of information and
all particulars required . for the Census; and in case no person shall be found at the
usual place of abode of such family, or individual living out of a family competent to
answer the inquiries, then it shall be lawful for the census employee to obtain the
required information as nearly as may be practicable from the family or families or
person or persons living nearest to such place of abode who may be competent to
answer such inquiries.   Each enumerator is required to prepare the returns and
forward the same to the supervisor of his district, within  thirty days unless by some
unavoidable causes he is prevented from submitting the same within the period
mentioned in which case an extension of time not exceeding fifteen days may be
authorized by the Director.

SEC. 14. The President of the Philippines is hereby authorized to do and to require
to be done any and all acts, or things necessary to carry out the purposes of this Act
and to delegate any and all authority in him vested in this Act to any official in
charge of census work.

SEC. 15. Partial or complete returns, reports, and other information may be
published from time to time by order of the President of the Philippines and the
returns shall be so prepared as to show the population and other statistics by
provinces, sub-provinces, district, municipalities, barrios, and other subdivisions,

SEC. 16. If in the judgment of the President of the Philippines, it shall appear that a
more completely accurate,  and economical census of the inhabitants of any of the:
areas, institutions, or establishments enumerated in the next following section of
this Act, can be secured by the owners, occupants, or persons in charge thereof
than by the regular enumerators, he may direct that the census of such areas,
institutions or establishments shall be made by such owners occupants, or persons
in charge, who shall thereupon take the oath prescribed for enumerators, or a
modified form thereof, in the discretion of the President of the Philippines, and shall



be subject to the penalties provided in this Act for the nonperformance or improper
performance of the duties required of enumerators, and shall have the powers
conferred upon enumerators. Said owners, occupants, or persons in charge shall be
required to complete such enumeration in a satisfactory manner and in accordance
with the instruction given them, and to deliver the schedules within the time
prescribed; and for such service as enumerators, they shall not receive any
compensation: Provided, That when such areas, institutions, or establish-ments are
the property of, or when the persons in charge of them are the employees of, the
Government of the United States or of the Philippines, such service shall not be
required, except with the prior approval of the head or chief of the department,
bureau, office, division or service concerned, of the Commanding General of the
Army or the commandants of naval stations, or of such other persons who have
power to authorize such service: And provided, further, That if any officer or
employee making enumeration is charged with the collection of such schedules, he
shall revise them and require the correction of all errors, and cause all data and
information omitted to be supplied; and if there is reasonable ground to believe that
such enumeration is incomplete or inaccurate, he may, if specifically authorized by
his superior officer, reënumerate the residents of such area institution or
establishment; and he also may, if such proceeding would facilitate the work of
reënumeration, and if he is specifically authorized by his superior officer, demand
that the resident of the premises be assembled for the verification of such
enumeration.

SEC. 17. The special areas, institutions, and establishments, which the owner,
occupant, or "other person in charge may be required to enumerate without
compensation under the provision of the next preceding section of this Act, may
include any or all of the following, together with the premises attached to them;
private dwelling houses occupied by literate persons who for any reason can be
more efficiently enumerated in such manner, to be enumerated by the householder,
landlord, or other person in charge; military and naval reservations, to be
enumerated by persons detailed by the commanding officers; public and private
hospitals, asylums, and charitable institutions, to be enumerated by the persons in
charge; prisons, jails, lockups, reform schools, and other penal institutions, to be
enumerated by the warden or other person in charge; army and any other police
barracks or quarters to be enumerated by persons detailed for such service by the
commanding officer; agricultural experiment stations, seed farms, stock farms,
breeding stations, and public works in operation or under construction, to be
enumerated by the persons in charge; convents and religious schools and
seminaries, to be enumerated by persons selected by the ecclesiastical authorities;
boarding or other schools, to be enumerated by the persons in charge; hotels,
boarding houses, lodging houses, cooperative messes and clubs having members
residing on the premises," or other such places or establishments, to be enumerated
by the proprietor, landlord, manager, managing director, or person in charge; public
civil reservations, to be enumerated by the person in charge; ships in harbor and
other boats, vessels, or craft to be enumerated by the master or other person in
charge; landed estates, forest concessions, private workshops and construction
works, to be enumerated by person in charge; and any other area, institution or
establishment of whatsoever character, to be enumerated by the person in charge:
Provided, however, That any person required in this section to perform any of the
duties indicated may delegate such duties to another, but shall himself subscribe,
take oath or otherwise certify to correctness of the enumeration made and shall be
responsible for such errors and omissions as may appear therein and shall be



subject to the penalties imposed by this Act.

SEC. 18. If, in the judgment of the President of the Philippines, it shall appear
practicable and desirable to collect in addition to any prescribed facts and statistics
relation to the population as individuals, further information relating to general
statistics including corporate bodies partnerships, associations, groups of persons
having joint or common interest, social and economic institutions industrial and
commercial enterprises, and agricultural and other forms of property of whatsoever
class, kind or character, he may direct that such information shall be collected and it
shall be obligatory on all proprietors, officers, partners, associates, directors,
administrators, managers and legal representatives of such corporations,
partnerships, associations, groups of persons, institutions, enterprises, and
properties, to furnish such information in the manner and within the time which may
be prescribed by regulation.   The collection of the information may be secured by
mailing or delivering the necessary forms and explanatory matter to the persons
best qualified to furnish it, in which cases such proprietors, officers, partners,
associates, directors, administrators, managers or legal representatives shall be
required to complete the schedules or forms themselves or cause them to be
completed, on their own responsibility, by their delegates, as provided in the next
preceding section.   The persons required to complete such schedules may also be
required mail or deliver them on completion, and within such time as may be
prescribed to a designated Census officer.

SEC. 19. No information obtained during the taking of this Census from any person
or corporation, association, partnership, institution, business enterprise, or group of
persons, having a join or common interest, however established or constituted shall
be used in any court or in any public office, either as evidence for or against the
person, corporation, association, partnership, institution, enterprise, or group, from
which such information emanates or for the purpose of basing thereon any
assessment or collection of taxes or public contributions; nor shall any such
information be divulged to any person, except to authorized Census officers acting
in the performance of their duties; and no Census officer or employee of the
Government shall make known to any other person not properly authorized in
Census known to any other person not properly authorized information
contemplated in this section, which, may have been secured during the Census
operations; nor shall any report or publication issued under the provisions of this Act
contain any information indicated in this section which would serve to identify the
person, corporation, association, partnership, institution, enterprise, group, or
property, from which it was secured, without the special consent in writing of the
proprietor, officer, director, administrator, manager or legal representative of such
person, corporation, association, partnership, institution, enterprise, group, or
property. The receipt by any officer, partner, associate, member, or stockholder of
any corporation, association, partnership, institution, business enterprise, or group,
of any schedule or form contemplated in this section shall constitute delivery to the
corporation, association, partnership, business enterprise or group, and the fact that
such officer, partner, associate, member, or stockholder is not the person who would
ordinarily complete such schedule or form shall not relieve him of responsibility for
the redelivery of such schedule or form to the proper person, shall it relieve such
proper person from the responsibility for the completion thereof.

SEC. 20. Whenever it shall appear to the President of the Philippines that any
portion of the enumeration and Census provided for in this Act is incomplete or


