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[ REPUBLIC ACT NO. 836, March 12, 1953 ]

AN ACT AUTHORIZING THE APPROPRIATION OF THE SUM OF
TWENTY MILLION PESOS ANNUALLY FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE

YEARS FOR THE CONSTRUCTION, RECONSTRUCTION,
IMPROVEMENT AND/OR REPAIR OF PUBLIC ELEMENTARY

SCHOOL BUILDINGS.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the Philippines in
Congress assembled: 




SECTION 1. The sum of twenty million pesos is hereby authorized to be
appropriated annually for a period of five years, beginning with the fiscal year 1953-
1954, out of any funds in the National Treasury not otherwise appropriated, for the
construction, reconstruction, improvement and/or repair of public elementary school
buildings. 




SEC 2. The amount made available for expenditure for each fiscal year under the
provisions of this Act shall be released by the Secretary of Public Works and
communication turns, in accordance with the provisions hereof, for the; construction
of new public elementary school buildings and for the repair, improvement and/or
reconstruction of public elementary school buildings damaged or destroyed by;
public calamities, such as fire, typhoon, flood, earthquake, or dissident action or by
ordinary wear and tear. 




SEC. 3. The Secretary of Education shall allocate for each fiscal year the share of
each province or city on the basis of the number of public elementary school pupils
not housed in permanent and semi-permanent public elementary school buildings in
such province or city in relation to the total number of such pupils in the entire
country during the preceding fiscal year. 




During the first fifteen days of each regular session of the Congress, he shall submit
a report of such allocation to. the Congress, which shall contain in addition a
recommendation of the public elementary school buildings in each province or city
which shall be constructed, reconstructed, improved and/or repaired as well as the
amounts estimated for the execution of each of such projects. On the basis of such
report, the Congress shall by law specify the public elementary school buildings that
shall be constructed, reconstructed, improved and/or repaired during the ensuing
fiscal year. If the Congress shall fail to enact such law for any fiscal year, the
aforementioned report and recommendation of the Secretary of Education shall be
deemed having been approved by the Congress and the public elementary school
building projects contained therein shall be executed: Provided, however, That the
specification of said projects as well as the allocation for such projects made by the
Secretary of Education for the fiscal year 1953-1954, in accordance with the
provisions hereof, shall be deemed as having been approved by the Congress:
Provided, further, That no release of the appropriation herein provided shall be


